Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015-2017

Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana
No. 183-2017/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 18,2017 (ASVINA 25, 1939 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 18th October, 2017

No. 31-HLA of 2017/86/20751.— The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Bill, 2017, is hereby
published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct
of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :-

Bill No. 31- HLA of 2017

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES & INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT BILL. 2017.

A
Bill
further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities & Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Shorttitle and

Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) (Amendment) Act, 2017. Commencement.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Amt‘_’ndTe‘}t of

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- ?f;;z?] a AO ot 14

(i)  in sub-section (1) for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be of 2016.
substituted; and

(il))  in sub-section (2), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be
substituted.

(4197)



4198 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), OCT. 18, 2017 (ASVN. 25, 1939 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions)
Act, 2016 was enacted to identify those areas falling within municipal limits where construction has taken place on
more than fifty percent plots prior to 31st March, 2015 to declare such areas as the Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas to provide Civic Amenities and Infrastructure in such Areas. In this Act under Section 4
“Enforcement to be kept in Abeyance” was for a period of one year which was upto 20.04.2017.

After enactment of the abovesaid Act under Section 4(1) of the Act the Department of Urban Local Bodies
Haryana has taken following action:

l. Issued guidelines to seek proposals from municipalities vide letter dated 10.7.2015.
2. Circulated the procedure vide memo dated 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 and 26.11.2016 to further regulate such
colonies.

3. Issued development charges vide order dated 04.10.2016 which has been kept on hold vide memo dated
21.10.2016.

4. Initiated the process of the survey of such Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas falling
within municipal limits in the State. Total 981 proposals of colonies from 80 municipalities have been received,
out of which 529 colonies have been found eligible.

In the meanwhile the one year period mentioned in the Section 4 of the Act has been completed, hence, it is
required to extend the period stated in the Section 4 of the Act for completion of the process. It is, therefore, proposed
that in Section 4 (1) and (2) of the Act the word “one year” may be substituted by the word “two years” so that one
more year may be made available to declare such eligible areas as Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas and the basic infrastructure may be provided in these areas.

KAVITA JAIN,
Urban Local Bodies Minister, Haryana.

Chandigarh: R. K. NANDAL,
The 18th October, 2017. Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), OCT. 18, 2017 (ASVN. 25, 1939 SAKA) 4199

[T S1gaTs]
2017 &1 fagrae =131 TA. VAU

BRI TRUIfersT &3 4 gl arRe gEgfaemsil aen Jawas &1 ya-e-d
(faely Sue~er) Gemeq faga®s, 2017
Ao TRuUIfadT &3 4 srqel arRe gegfaens an sawan
g (faeiy Suse) 3rferfa=H, 2016,
I AT Hefea
P B fag
fagas

YRd TR & 3reded 9y § sRImom Isg fdue gvsa gry f=faRaa w9 # I
rferfrafag 8-

1. (1) I8 fafe sRamen TRurfere &l # orgel AR gEgfansii qeI sfawRa-r  war 7 qer
BT Ugwed ([ Suaw) () T, 2017, HET ST AdhaT 2 | R |

(2)  IE 21 37U, 2016 | FAN] TAT FHM ST |
2. BRI TRUMART &A1 H YUl ARG GEG LA TAT FGHET BT Yawe ([ery 2016 1 gRaw

U rfAfTH, 2016 BT RT 4 H— Waﬁﬁf WM kol
(i) SU-gRT (1) ¥ 'TF 99" YRl b W W, QY g9’ g yfoenid fHy S e
qoIT

() SU-URT (2) # "TH 99" U@l b WM W, "I IY° g ufRenfud fHy Swg |



4200 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), OCT. 18, 2017 (ASVN. 25, 1939 SAKA)
IRl IR BRI &1 faa=or

RAN TRUferRr ol eraf # ArIRe  ragfaumell do fewRad T & uawe ([P Suew)
arfefrae, 2016 Urferept AHRI # TS dTel S &A1 BT Uge+1 & ford i fbar ar o Sl 31.3.2015 4
qd 50 UfcRrd @il W REr fEar S gar @ B ARG GEgaumil 9T SaHvadl UaH a1 & ford 39 &l
DI ARTRSG FEGAL3N TAT JGHIEAT QU] TR ThT &7 BIfd a1 ST & | 39 AMRFRE & aRT 4 ‘gaaq
SRYATT X@AT TP ¥ Bl Al & forg off, Sl 20.04.2017 T o7 |

Sad Irffam & Jfafaffd s S we) ey e T gRT fAeforlRad eriarsr @ =iy

1, TR UIfThIsh | URdTd UTd &R & foIv ua fedid 10.7.2015 gRT fe9m fcer Ry fu v |

2. 39 dXE P Pralal ol 3R fafafid a7 & fow srua foAie 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 3R 26.11.2016 &
qegy | Uihar b gRenferd fear |

3. QY fAIF 04.10.2016 ERT fHM™ gob TR Y 7g, R MU+ f&A76 21.10.2016 & §RT A I@T 17
=

4. g H UIfTdT ARl & ST U ANTRSG GRIGIAemall T Siaavel Y0l ARUTfIdhT &3 & §d dl
UfhaT 3TR™T &) &V | ft 981 BIANTAT & UG 80 TWRUTfTdw13l o U g4 2, o A 529 WRayd Ay
T E
S AR, 39 IR @ T 4 # I vE af @ e @ 8 gt 7, ord: wrl @ yofar & ford g

IfAFTTH 9IRT 4 BT IIAT TM BT IFATIRAT B | S I UAIIT & b 50 IR & 11T 4(1) T2 4(2)

H Tl UP Al Bl Teal &l A ¥ gacl QA1 - difd U IRY &3 $l ANRE GEgaarsi qoi Jad-a

YT TRUfTADT &7 | R & ol U 3= ATl U HRAAT S Fab oI 59 &3 3 Hold Gauri U&=

@1 S AqS |

Pfaar o,
) YR e 53, R |

Q=TI 18 3faER, 2017. e |

55696—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Chd.



